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Alice in Wonderland syndrome as an initial
manifestation of Epstein-Barr virus infection

M Cinbis, S Aysun

Abstract
We present a patient with serologicaily con-
firmed Epstein-Barr virus (EBV) infection who
had illusions of size, shape, and colour of
objects but none of the typical symptoms and
signs peculiar to infectious mononucleosis
(IM) except sore throat which developed 2
weeks after the initial visual disturbances. The
bizarre feelings about the images of body and
objects are called the 'Alice in Wonderland
syndrome' due to the similarity with Alice's
dreams. The same symptomatology including
visual metamorphosia is defined in patients
with migraine, epilepsy, intoxication due to
hallucinogenic drugs, schizophrenia, hyper-
pyrexia, and cerebral lesions. Alice in Wonder-
land syndrome has also been reported in the
course of IM.
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Case report
A 7-year-old girl complained of seeing objects
smaller and in different colours than they were,
such as seeing her mother's head green and
smaller in comparison with her body. These
metamorphoses were intermittent lasting a few
minutes. She was first examined by an ophthal-
mologist whose examination including colour
vision was completely normal. Neither visual
agnosia nor nominal dysphasia was a complaint.
However the patient was never examined during
an attack, each of which lasted a few minutes. It
was thought that she was faking. Her complaints
continued and she was admitted to Hacettepe
Children's Hospital. Her physical and neuro-
logical examinations were normal. Laboratory
investigations included a normal brain scan and
minimal irregularity of background activity over
the posterior areas of the EEG. Estimations of
antibodies of types IgG and IgM for EBV were

positive by enzymatic immunoassay. The level of
IgG antibodies in our patient was 1 2 and that of
IgM antibodies was 2-8. During the follow-up
period lasting 5 months no other complication
occurred and visual symptoms recovered spon-
taneously. She has been completely normal for 6
months.

There was no personal or family history of
epilepsy, migraine, or drug use. The only
remarkable information about the family was
that her father had had a serologically confirmed
hepatitis A infection but our patient was sero-

negative for HAV.

Discussion
Various neurological and psychological mani-
festations may occur during or after IM. '' These
include meningoencephalitis, encephalitis, the
Guillain-Barre syndrome, mononeuritis,
personality changes such as irritability, emotion-

ality, asocial behaviour, destructiveness, depres-
sion and anxiety, benign recurrent aseptic
meningitis (Mollaret's meningitis), inappro-
priate antidiuretic hormone secretion, myalgic
encephalomyelitis syndrome, acute transverse
myelopathy, acute cerebellar ataxia, convul-
sions, and retinochoroiditis.5''4
One of the perceptual disturbances in IM is

the Alice in Wonderland syndrome. A few cases
have been reported after Copperman's first
report. Visual metamorphosia was described in
patients reported by Copperman' as a presenting
symptom, but it was realised during the examina-
tion that there were other signs suggesting IM,
such as generalised lymphadenopathy, spleno-
megaly, and rash. On the other hand in the
patient reported by Sanguineti2 the length of
time elapsing between the initiation of visual
symptoms and the development of signs suggest-
ing IM is not known accurately. Since this
patient was examined by an ophthalmologist
initially it is not known whether she had these
other clinical signs at that time. Subsequently
Eshel et al3 and Lahat' reported two patients with
the Alice in Wonderland syndrome which
developed after IM.

It is easy to recognise this in a patient with full
blown features of IM but this is not so if the
visual disturbances preceded the classic symp-
toms of IM or ifIM follows a subclinical course.
When our patient suffered from micropsia there
was no other sign suggesting IM.

This patient is another example of the exten-
sive variation of the presenting symptoms of IM
reminding us to keep the Alice in Wonderland
syndrome in mind in patients with visual
illusions but no other symptoms.
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